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Message from  
the President

ear Friend 
of Cam-
phill,
Joy exudes 
from the 

students at Camphill 
Special School. If you 
have been lucky enough 
to meet them, you 
know this. This joy and 
their love for life and 
learning is contagious. I 
consider it an honor and 
a privilege to be part of 
the community for over 
16 years. As a fellow 
supporter, I am sure you 
feel the same. 

Serving on the Board 
of Directors, I am 
fortunate to know many 
of the inner workings 
of Camphill and have 
a strong conviction to 
uphold the principles

that have allowed 
countless children and 
their families to flourish 
and grow. Every student 
is seen as a unique, 
complete individual 
whose disability does 
not define them. Our 
programs and curricula 
are built upon enabling 
each child to shine in 
their own way — taking 
what makes them unique 
and bringing that to the 
forefront. It could be 
weaving, physics, 

woodworking, drama, 
mathematics, gardening, 
or whatever subject 
enables the development 
of each child’s true self.

Unique minds abound 
at Camphill Special 
School! They include 
the incredible students 
who benefit from your 
generous contributions; 
our Camphill 
Academy students 
who are learning our 
methodology to advance 
curative education at our

school and beyond; the 
dedicated houseparents, 
faculty, therapists, staff, 
and volunteers who 
share their time, talents, 
expertise, compassion, 
and love; and you, our 
generous donors who 
sustain the school and 
the many students and 
families that benefit.

With thanks,
Craig L. Adams
President,  
Board of Directors

If a child  
cannot learn 
in the way we 
teach them, 
we must teach 
them in the 
way that they 
can learn.  
— Unknown
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The Way to  
What He Sees

o us, this 
poem and 
this picture 
absolutely 
capture the 
heart of 

Camphill Special School. 
The peaceful young man 
in this picture sitting 
on the porch of Rowan 
House is our son Marcus. 
His life story is amazing 
and would not be the 
same without Camphill 
Special School. 

At one year old, Marcus 
entered our lives and 
our hearts. While 
adopting our oldest 
son in Romania, we 
were informed he had a 
younger brother. Within 
the same hour we were 
united with our oldest 
son, we drove by the 
orphanage where Marcus 

was and were told we 
could visit. We had a 
chance to briefly hold 
Marcus, who was eight 
pounds at one year old 
and failing to thrive. 
When we came home to 
Downingtown to unite 
our daughter with her 
new brother, Marcus 
was constantly on our 
minds. Special children 
have a way of taking 
your heart, and it wasn’t 
long before we began the 
adoption process to have 
Marcus join our family. 
Despite a moratorium 
on international 

adoptions enacted 
by Romania, Marcus’ 
adoption was approved 
two years later thanks 
to a United Nations 
law that biological 
siblings have the right 
to grow up together. The 
same day that Marcus’ 
adoption was finalized 
in court, the Romanian 
government permanently 
shut down all 
international adoptions, 
which remains in effect 
today. Marcus’ journey is 
a miracle.   

Deep gratitude for 
Marcus being home with 

us was followed by much 
doctoring, therapy, and 
special needs parenting. 
Every developmental 
milestone was an 
absolute celebration. 
Clapping or pointing for 
the first time were as if 
Marcus had walked on 
the moon. Every setback 
was heart wrenching. 
Marcus suffered from 
immune deficiency, 
illnesses, chronic GI 
pain, and lack of growth. 
He cried for many hours 
and slept for very few. 

Our worries mounted as 
did Marcus’ diagnoses. 

BY STACY AND ANDY JENKINS, PARENTS OF MARCUS

The warm embrace you still receive
From the light that glows around

It shines upon all that you see
It is time to look around.

You will see the many things
That you have yet to discover

Show us the way to what you see
And we will lift the cover.   

— Written for Marcus by Tobias Adams

Time and love weren’t 
bridging the gap of severe 
developmental delay, 
autistic detachment, self-
injury, and aggression. 
We believed we were 
the viable home and 
family for Marcus but 
needed more structure 
and hands than we could 
manage. What would 
we do? Where could we 
turn? If Marcus needed 
residential care, we could 
not imagine him back in 
any sort of institutional 
setting. 

Little did we know 
that fifty years earlier, 
Camphill came from 
Europe with a mission 
to build a community 
for special children 
that began initially 
on a property literally 
across the road from 
our house. And now, 
Marcus had come from 
Eastern Europe needing 
this exact community, 
the kind of community 
and school that would 
desire what this poem 
says—to lift the cover 
and help him discover 
many things. Camphill 
is in the business of 
transformations and 
miracles. The peace 
that is epitomized in 
this picture of Marcus 
is nothing short of 
miraculous. 

How many people first 
visit Camphill Special 
School and say how 
peaceful it is? This 
beautiful hillside setting 
embraces nature as a 
great teacher. But it’s 
more than this that 
reaches our kids, it’s a 
unique environment 

that draws out the 
unique mind of each 
individual student. The 
poem says, “Show us the 
way to what you see.” 
The desire of Camphill 
Special School is to take 
the time, and have the 
patience, to delve into 
each unique student’s 
world and find out who 
they are inside. There is a 
remarkable commitment 
to the students—
they are poured into, 
drawn out, discovered, 
reflected upon, and 
respected. Adapting to 
the uniqueness of each 
student leads to a great 
connection and trust. 

To meet such diverse 
individual needs requires 
both structure and 
flexibility. How thankful 

we are for the team of 
teachers, house parents, 
therapists, and coworkers 
who work with diligence 
and devotion to develop 
Marcus’ whole body, 
mind, and spirit. 
Marcus’ strengths are 
strengthened and he 
can show the way to 
what he sees. He can 
communicate now, 
through technology, but 
even more importantly 
through relation, which 
has led to cognition and 
skill building as well 
as joy and playfulness. 
Marcus is a contributing 
member of the 
community, especially 
working in the garden, 
which is fitting as he too 
is blossoming where he is 
planted.  

Now Marcus is thriving! 
There are still challenges, 
but he is full of peace 
and discovery. And we 
are full of gratitude for 
the dedicated support. 
This is extended family 
living, and it is life- 
changing for our family. 
Like us and his siblings, 
this community knows 
and cherishes Marcus. 
It seems Marcus has 
captured a few hearts 
along the way. Our hearts 
are full to see Marcus’ 
journey continue at 
Camphill Special School, 
to see his wonderful, 
unique mind open more 
and more to the world 
and to others. Bless 
Camphill Special School!   
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But why should 
he paint?

pstairs in 
Celandine, 
our medical 
therapeutic 
building, is a 
room which 

many don’t know about. 
It is the Robert Musil 
Library and hosts many 
rare books from Carlo 
Pietzner’s collection. It is 
also where children have 
art therapy. It is usually 
set up for painting, 
sometimes for drawing 
or clay modeling. Two 
chairs with aprons 
draped across their 
backs sit in front of a 
covered table with a set 
of premixed watercolor 
paints next to the white 
sheet of stretched paper. 
The large windows face 
the green foliage, and 

no traffic or people 
distract the view. Apart 
from a few noises from 
downstairs, it is a quiet 
space.

Jordan has been painting 
here for the last two 
years. He comes twice a 
week for just over half an 
hour. He puts down his 
large helmet and colorful 
bag with emergency 
supplies. He dons a red 
apron and is ready. We 
talk for awhile about 

what is on his mind, so 
we can leave that world 
behind. He picks up 
the brush and dips into 
vermilion red.

Jordan’s first pictures had 
a chaotic energy to them, 
and in the course of the 
session they became ever 
darker. But the outcome 
never bothered him. 
He does not subscribe 
to an overly self-critical 
mindset. In many 
sessions Jordan wanted 

to paint a favorite item 
like a new watch, his 
latest t-shirt, an Audi. He 
wanted help in executing 
these things. 

But why should he paint? 
What can painting do for 
you? Many people testify 
that it makes you more 
sensitive to the colors 
around you; things seem 
more alive. I often notice 
that it changes breathing 
rhythm. There can be 
many other effects.

BY ELSE WOLF

We talk for 
awhile about 
what is on his 
mind, so we 
can leave that 
world behind. 
He picks up 
the brush and 
dips into ver-
milion red.  
— Else Wolf

When Jordan wanted 
to paint the airplane 
taking him home to 
Jamaica, I suggested that 
he also paint the waves 
around the island. He 
enjoyed imitating the 
swishing noise of the 
surf as we painted the 
blue. I noticed that he 
needed the dissolving, 
flowing quality of the 
water, so there were a few 
paintings with similar 
themes. In the autumn 
the falling leaves of a 
tree became a wonderful 
movement of letting go. 
I could hear him sigh. 
What mattered was not 
actual painting, but the 
process of the experience.

Not every time turned 

out so well. In one 
session, we were trying 
to paint flowers and he 
got quite silly, splashing 
the paint. I had to bring 
things to a close before 
it escalated. As we were 
walking back to the 
schoolhouse, he noticed 
a little yellow flower by 
the roadside. He stopped 
in his tracks and shouted: 
“I made that!”

Another time, Jordan 
announced that he 
wanted to paint purple. 
I gave him a very wide 
Japanese brush and told 
him that he could mix 
it himself. This became 
a whole new path of 
experience. He loved 
this magical happening 

and did not care about it 
looking like something 
recognizable. His posture 
changed too over time. 
He used to slouch, 
bent over his painting 
board. Now he sits more 
upright and awake with 
a sparkle in his eye. 
Jordan developed a new 
confidence. He loves 
mixing secondary colors. 
They were mostly applied 
in horizontal stripes. 
Sometimes he returned 
to forms like the sun 
and moon, but when 
I tried to direct him 
towards working further 
with them, he was dead 
against it. I guess he was 
becoming an abstract 
painter, and I had better 
accept it!  

He really enjoyed the 
unfolding of the process. 
Sometimes I asked him if 
it still needed something 
else, and without missing 
a beat, he replied, 
knowing exactly what he 
wanted.

Finally, he managed to 
create a whole picture 
again, feeling very proud 
and confident, as an artist 
in his own right. He has 
now completed twelfth 
grade and will move 
on to the Transition 
Program at Beaver Farm. 
We had a wonderful 
journey together.   
Thank you, Jordan!  
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very teacher 
values the 
individual 
contributions 
that each 
student brings 

to the class—love of 
learning, making others 
feel appreciated, artistic 
or musical gifts, being 
able to persevere with 
tasks, or enjoying the 
stories the teacher is 
telling. But sometimes, 
we keep a special place 
in our heart for those 
students who share 
a particular love of a 
subject that we love 
as well. As a Waldorf ® 
school, Camphill Special 
School tries to balance 
the interplay of learning 
through head, heart, 
and hands.  

As a teacher of the 
special subject of 
Handwork, I have been 
allowed to share the gift 
of learning to create 
with your hands with 
many students. And I 
have been allowed to 

experience some of the 
unique ways in which 
our students respond 
both with enthusiasm 
and with creative 
problem solving when 
they experience the 
challenge of learning a 
new manual skill. Jenna 
and Eva are two students 
who share in my love of 
the crafts.  

Jenna, a senior, came 
to Camphill for high 
school and joined our 
prevocational program, 
where all students 
practice acquiring new 
skills in the context of 
an actual workshop or 
outdoor setting. Jenna’s 
first placement was the 
Weaving Workshop, 
where she could unfold 
her love of making 
things, and she chose to 
return to this workshop 
three times over the 
years. She also joined us 
in the Pottery Workshop 
and requested to be 
part of this group each 
year. Jenna learned to 

be an excellent weaver 
and potter, continually 
surprising all of us in 
the workshop with her 
unique color and design 
choices. If everyone else 
was making a round 
plate, you could count on 
Jenna to be brave enough 
to try making a square 
one. If the next logical 
color in a sequence was 
green, Jenna would try 
orange. Her projects 
were both unique and 
beautiful. Jenna, as a 
true artist, is brave, 
loves experimenting, 
and works very hard to 
implement her ideas. 

Eva also has a love of 
making things, and 
though, at times, she 
may struggle to get 
her hands to do what 
she wants them to, her 
determination and 
enthusiasm always 
triumph. Eva will never 
say, “That’s too hard for 
me.” She will give it a try 
every time. When we 
were learning to sew our 

own handwork bags, Eva 
had poked herself a few 
times with the needle 
and was a little cross. 
So, together, we found a 
piece of foam to put a hat 
on “Nancy needle,” and 
Eva never tired of waiting 
until Nancy had her hat 
on and she could pull the 
needle through the cloth. 
Despite the waiting, 
Eva was determined to 
finish her project at the 
same time as everyone 
else. Eva is also very 
clear about her color 
and design choices, and 
now that we are learning 
to knit (and she already 
can), you will see her in 
the autumn wearing her 
warm, bright red wool 
hat!

These are two students 
whose unique approach 
to learning has taught 
me to listen, be patient, 
problem solve, and 
finally—to be a better 
teacher. 

We try to  
balance the 
interplay 
of learning 
through  
head, heart, 
and hands.  
— Tina Bruckner

To Be a Better 
Teacher

BY TINA BRUCKNER, HANDWORK TEACHER
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Cirque du Camphill 
Gala and Village  
Racquet ProAm

June 3 and 4, 2016

ombine 
a hula- 
hooping 
stilt 
walker, 
two 

aerialists serving wine, 
and over 350 supporters 
wearing red noses, top 
hats, and even a full 
clown costume and 
you have one heck of 
a Gala! With the fast-
talking auctioneer Lori 
Zytkowicz at the mic 
and generous bidders, 
the live auction was a 
record-breaker. The High 
School Choir dazzled 
and The Sonic Tonic 
provided great tunes, all 
while the crowd noshed 
on delectable food from 
Brûlée Catering and 
sipped custom cocktails 
and craft beer from 
Berkshire Mountain 
Distillers and Hunterdon 
Brewing.

Village Racquet ProAm 
patrons were treated to 
yummy lunch, a water 
ice truck, palm reading, 
games, popcorn, cotton 
candy, fire juggling, an 
aerialist, and awesome 
tennis from Tennis 
Addiction’s junior 
players.

Over $270,000 was 
raised thanks to you, our 
friends, to benefit our 
students. Thank you so 
much for making the 
event a real three-ring 
circus—and for helping 
our students enjoy the 
one-of-a-kind education 
that allows them to 
thrive!

Camphill Special School 
also had the honor of 
inducting the first two 

organizations into our 
Corporate Partners 
Program at this year’s 
Gala. PECO has provided 
a lead sponsorship for 
the ProAm since its 
beginning, but its truly 
remarkable gift has 
been its investment in 
people. The men and 
women who keep our 
lights on have served 

as leaders of our board, 
experts in maintenance 
processes, contract and 
design experts, and 
personal donors to help 
our children. Without 
Tennis Addiction, the 
Gala and ProAm would 
not be in existence. 
Anthony DeCecco, his 
staff, members, and 
friends have poured their 

time, energy, talents, and 
treasure into the event 
over the years, helping to 
raise over $3 million for 
the school through the 
events.

LADIES AND GENTLEMEN, BOYS AND GIRLS STEP RIGHT UP FOR THE . . . 

Amy Walker, Gala Chair
Anthony J. DeCecco, 
	 Jr., Tennis 
	 Tournament Chair
Rosemary Huether, 
	 Ambiance Chair
Matt Siefert, 
	 Auction Chair
Amy McHugh, 
	 Program Chair
John R. Fish, O.D., 
	 Sponsorship Chair
Melissa Epps
Brent Franklin
Karuna Kasturi
Caroline McCardell
Jeff Rightnour
Sue Rushing
Helen Walter

Grand Slam Sponsors 
CSI International
Customers Bank
Pat and Linda Marion
Utility Line Services

Advantage Sponsors
Eagle Eye Associates
Unlimited Technology

Ace Sponsor
Carla and Lydia Schulze

ProAm  
Committee

Presenting Sponsors 

Along with Bill & 
Betsy Herman 

In Memory of Ursel Pietzner

Major Cup Sponsors 
Asplundh Tree Expert Co.
CH&E Construction
Lynn Garner and Evan Evans
Henkels & McCoy, Inc.
Kimberton Whole Foods
Drs. Andrew and Heather 		
	 Revelis Family  
	 Foundation
Tennis Addiction Sports Club

Tennis Cup Sponsors 
Archer & Buchanan
	  Architecture, Ltd.
Elliott-Lewis Corp.
Joseph P. Heenan Family 		
	 Foundation
Paul Restall Company
Philips Brothers Electrical 		
	 Contractors
T.O. Epps & Associates, Inc.

Wild Card Sponsors 
AAA
Berta and Mike Aldrich
Marjorie and Drew Alleva
Guy and Ani Alma
BCA Philadelphia
Brandywine Valley Financial 		
	 Services LLC
Campbell, Rapplold & 
	 Yurasits LLP
Carnevale Eustis Architects
CertaPro Painter of the 
	 Main Line
Delaney & Scott, PC
Delaware Center for Maternal 	
	 and Fetal Health of 
	 Christiana Care
Delaware Valley Paving
Scott and Janice Fleming
Fox Rothschild LLP
Amy and Warren R. Gleicher
HDI Associates
Rosemary and Bob Huether
Kistler Tiffany Benefits
McMahon Automotive Group
Dave and Kristen O’Brien
Mr. and Mrs. Brian J. 
	 O’Connell

Mr. and Mrs. Thomas 
	 Rosendale
Ari and Abby Segal
SITE Engineering Concepts
Stradley Ronon Stephens & 		
	 Young, LLP
John and Deborah Thomas
Univest – Banking, Insurance, 	
	 Investments

In-Kind Sponsors 
Audiovisual
Advanced Staging 
	 Productions
Catering
Brûlée Catering
Cocktail
Berkshire Mountain Distillers
Craft Beer
Hunterdon Brewing
Printing Services
Prestige Color
Trophies
Spike’s
Venue
Phoenixville Foundry

THANK YOU 

ALL FOR A 

WONDERFUL 

EVENT!
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The Rise of the 
Meadowsweeties

n front of my 
desk is a window 
that looks out 
onto Chantry’s 
playground.  
Beyond the 

wooden picket fence 
and amongst the tall 
grass you can find our 
children of the beloved 
Meadowsweet playing. 
I’d see them there many 
times. There was one day 
in particular that left a 
lasting impression on me: 
It was a busy morning 
with people rushing in 
and out of the office, 
packages arriving in 
heaps, the phone ringing 
constantly, our copier 
refusing to do the one 
task it was designed for, 
and I had witnessed two 
student meltdowns—all 
this before ten o’clock in 
the morning. Imagine a 
sort of frantic “busy bee” 
soundtrack attached to 
this scene. 

Eventually came a 
moment when I looked 
out the window and 
was able to experience 
a wholesome sense of 
tranquility over the 
chaos. Watching the 
children gave me a deep 
sense of peace, and the 
more I watched, the 
more a pattern started 
to form. At first, it was 
sporadic: two children on 
the swings, two sitting on 
the ground, one running 
enthusiastically, and a 
few more exploring the 
land—picking flowers 
and sorting rocks. But 
then, looking closer, 
there was something 
more there, some 
captivating rhythm that 
was driving the children 

to their specific activity. 
It contained a sort of 
untamed desire but it was 
perfectly matched with 
sincere focus, even in 
the aimlessness of their 
interest. Everything the 
children were doing had 
this desire and focus that 
I believe comes from 
the heart and mind, 
respectively. It’s what 
forms the uniqueness 
of each child: how they 
perceive and react to 
their environment and, 
later, to the world. 
It was then I realized 

there was a deep 
education in process 
here, and our children 
of Meadowsweet, who 
I affectionately refer to 
as our Meadowsweeties, 
are the forefront, 
building blocks, and the 
superheroes of this early 
education journey. It 
starts with them. After 
all, it was none other 
than the great Aristotle 
who said, “Educating the 
mind without educating 
the heart is no education 
at all.” It’s as if the heart 
and mind are the parents, 

and the soul—the 
essence, the uniqueness 
—is the child. The 
“parents” need to grow 
and develop together 
in order to be fully 
supportive of the child. 
As people grow up, it’s 
easier to function from 
the mind than the heart, 
and sometimes we need 
a reminder, especially 
amidst the chaos, of just 
how important it is to 
continually develop both. 
And sometimes, all it 
takes is looking out your 
window.   

BY KARUNA KASTURI, RECEPTIONIST

Educating  
the mind 
without  
educating  
the heart is  
no education 
at all.  
— Aristotle



CAMPHILL SPECIAL SCHOOL      ANNUAL REPORT 2015 / 2016 CAMPHILLSPECIALSCHOOL.ORG 2120

A Unique Year at Camphill Special School

July 2015
After the passing of our 
founder, Ursel Pietzner, 
David Newbatt comes to 
campus to create art on 
the walls of Meadowsweet. 
Special thanks are given  
to Mrs. Champion for  
funding David’s visit  
and art installations.

August 
2015
Eva, a fifth grader, runs a 
roadside smoothie stand to 
raise money for Camphill 
Special School. She was 
able to donate $212.22 to 
the school!

September 
2015
Ursel had always asked that 
after she passed away a 
lilac bush would be planted 
in her memory outside 
Rainbow Hall. This request 
was fulfilled with much 
pomp and circumstance, 
befitting the occasion.

October 
2015
The official ribbon-cutting 
of Meadowsweet is  
celebrated with music, 
speeches, and a stroll down 
the newly forged path from 
the schoolhouse to the 
Early Learning Center.

November 
2015
Transition Program stu-
dents learn to identify trees 
by their autumnal colors 
and leaves. They also learn 
about their importance as 
providers of wood, shade, 
habitats, and oxygen.

December 
2015
High School Student Coun-
cil members organize a 
food drive and help deliver 
a van full of donations to 
the North Coventry Food 
Pantry.

January 
2016
Ninth graders learn 
firsthand—or face?—how 
the ancient Greeks made 
masks for their dramatic 
performances.

February 
2016
Fifth grader Antonio plays 
the cello and piano at 
a Thursday afternoon 
concert.

March 2016 
Eighth graders cultivate 
their sense of self-move-
ment and experience 
counter movement 
through Spacial Dynamic 
sessions.

April 2016
The second grade class 
receives a rocking horse for 
their classroom thanks to 
Lily, sister of second grader 
Katie. Instead of birthday 
gifts, Lily asked for dona-
tions toward purchasing 
the toy.

May 2016
High school students party 
down at their Western-themed 
Prom, complete with wanted 
posters and barbeque fare.

June 2016
The last month of the year 
was chock full of distinctive 
events of note: Not only did 
we have aerialists serving 
wine while dangling from 
the ceiling at the Gala, but 
our senior class presented 
Frankenstein as their com-
mencement play. The class 
also traveled to Vermont, 
where they hiked Mount 
Elmore. The entire school 
also said farewell to Elsbeth 
Sunstein with a retirement 
celebration on the last day 
of school.
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ne of  
the 
unique 
aspects 
of 

Camphill Special 
School is a medical-
therapeutic team that 
is closely integrated 
with the school and 
home life. Our work 
arises out of a form of 
Integrative Medicine 
called Anthroposophic 
Medicine. It relies on 
and uses conventional 
medicine and more 
commonly known 
therapies, such as 
Physical, Occupational, 
and Speech Therapy, and 
integrates them with 
lifestyle adjustments (e.g., 
diet, activity, rhythm), 
self-empowerment, 
natural remedies, other 
modalities of healing, 
and innovative therapies. 
At our school, these 
include Eurythmy (a 
movement therapy), 
Rhythmical Massage, Oil 
Dispersion Bath, Color-

Light, Music, and Art 
therapies.

Anthroposophic 
Medicine was pioneered 
in Switzerland through 
the collaboration of the 
philosopher and educator 
Rudolf Steiner with the 
physician Ita Wegman. 
In its understanding of 
the human being, the 
physical body, enlivened 
by a life organism, 
enables the soul and 
spiritual individuality 
to express themselves 
in and learn from 
the world and social 
interactions. Our team 
strives to integrate these 
different aspects of the 
human being into our 
understanding of health 
and illness, diagnosis 
and therapy, and to 
thereby develop an 

approach which serves 
each individual’s unique 
ways of developing and 
healing. Based on this 
approach, medical-
therapeutic care for 
acute and chronic issues 
is provided on campus 
to our students in close 
collaboration with 
parents, homemakers, 
and teachers. 

The common 
understanding of the 
human being enables 
Anthroposophic 
Medicine to integrate 
naturally and fruitfully 
with Waldorf Education 
and Camphill life in 
general. The homemaker, 
teacher, a therapist, 
the school physician, 
and coworkers hold an 
interdisciplinary meeting 
once a year for each 

student to form a shared 
picture of the individual, 
the steps they have taken, 
and the challenges that 
remain for their further 
development. Out of 
this, we strive to come 
to an understanding of 
each student’s unique 
developmental and 
biographical situation 
and what supports and 
approaches it calls for in 
the different areas of our 
work. 

These are high goals to 
strive for, and we are 
deeply committed to 
them. We are grateful 
for the trust our students 
and their families place 
in us, and the possibility 
to share a part of life’s 
journey with them.

We are  
grateful for  
the trust  
our students 
and their  
families  
place in us.  
— Raphael J. Knauf, M.D. A Unique Integrative 

Medical-Therapeutic 
Approach

BY RAPHAEL J. KNAUF, M.D., SCHOOL PHYSICIAN
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CLEANED WOOL 
FOR PROCESSING  
AT BEAVER FARM

HELPED DURING  
MAIN LESSONS IN  
THE CLASSROOMS

PACKAGED AND 
WRAPPED A HUNDRED 
AUCTION ITEMS 

SPENT THEIR SPRING 
BREAK CLEARING LAND 
AT THE FARM

FOLDED LETTERS AND 
STUFFED ENVELOPES FOR 
MAILINGS

COLLECTED, CLIPPED, 
AND COUNTED BOX TOPS 
FOR EDUCATION

LENT THEIR GREEN 
THUMBS TO THE GREEN-
HOUSE AND GARDENS

ATTENDED MONTHLY 
MEETINGS TO PLAN 
ANOTHER SUCCESSFUL 
GALA

CREATED AND LAID OUT 
THE YEARBOOK FOR OUR 
HIGH SCHOOL STUDENTS

DESIGNED AND BUILT 
CENTERPIECES, AND 
TURNED THE FOUNDRY 
INTO A CIRCUS

Volunteer 
Hours

Individuals:

1,660

Groups:

2,475

Board:

356

Committees: 

805

Total:

5,296

PREPARED DELICIOUS 
AND NUTRITIOUS LUNCH 
EACH WEEK FOR ONE OF 
THE HOUSES

MOVED (LITERALLY) A 
TON OF GRAVEL FOR 
A PATH CONNECTING 
THE SCHOOLHOUSE TO 
MEADOWSWEET

We were fortunate to have many groups so generous with their time. 
These include Alternative Spring Break from Virginia Commonwealth 
University, The Foundation Stone School in Taiwan, Owen J. Roberts 
High School’s Leo Club, Vanguard, several Waldorf Schools, and 
Unlimited Technology, Inc.

The invaluable contribution of time and energy from our dedicated 
volunteers is inspiring. Their work and commitment make life even 
better for the students, teachers, coworkers, and staff at Camphill.  
We are grateful for their service.

Our incredible volunteers shared many unique talents and skills with the 
Camphill Special School community this year. Here are just a few of the 
many, many things they did:
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Where He 
Learned to Work

eter was a 
friendly guy. 
He loved 
people and 
he loved 
to talk. He 

was the ultimate social 
butterfly. Peter would 
move from person to 
person, exchanging 
greetings, asking 
questions, and smiling 
his big, winsome smile. 

Peter’s problem was with 
work. It was hard to 
stay focused when there 
were so many people 
to meet, and at Beaver 
Farm there were people 
everywhere: gardeners 
working in the vegetable 
beds, landscapers 
laying pathways, cooks 
running food scraps to 
the compost bins, and 
farmers herding cows. 
If Peter was a social 
butterfly, Beaver Farm 
was a flower-bright 
garden!

Peter began working at 

Beaver Farm two years 
ago, and his assignment 
was the barn. The barn 
runs 24/7. There is much 
routine work to do: 
mucking out the stalls, 
feeding the chickens and 
the pigs, hauling hay 
for the cows, collecting 
hundreds of eggs, and 
making sure every living 
thing has plenty of water 
to drink. In the spring 
and fall the cattle must 
be taken out to pasture at 
night and brought back 

to the cool shade of the 
barnyard in the morning. 
New sections of meadow 
are cordoned off with 
electric fence, a tricky 
job that must be carefully 
done if you want to keep 
the cattle away from the 
vegetable gardens. The 
sheep must be corralled 
and shepherded to fresh 
grass. Broiler chickens 
are moved to a fresh 
patch of green field 
twice a day. Sometimes 
there are hay wagons to 

unload, a hot and sweaty 
job that everyone looks 
forward to and then hates 
until they have pushed 
the last bale into place 
in the hay mow. And 
the favorite job of all? 
That would be watching 
the birth of the animals, 
and helping here and 
there when the mothers 
need it. The calves come 
at any time of year, big 
slugs of beauty falling 
wet to the barn floor 
for the cows to lick and 

BY ANI ALMA, BARN CREW LEADER AT THE TRANSITION PROGRAM

He knows  
he is needed 
and he knows 
how to help, 
and that has 
made all the  
difference.  
— Ani Alma

fuss over. The sows are 
all-season performers 
too, but they give birth 
to a long succession of 
tiny pink cuddly toys, 
and the joyful show can 
last for a couple of hours. 
Mid-winter is the time 
for lambing. The lambs 
are the sweetest of all the 
critters in the barn, but 
their mothers often need 
the most help. There is 
sometimes a dramatic 
tension to the lambing 
sessions, and there are 
no guarantees that things 
will go well. When they 
do, the happy relief of the 
experience is palpable in 
the crowd that gathers to 
watch.

This is the world that 
Peter entered, and this 
is where he learned to 
work. Peter wasn’t sure 

what the tools were 
called. Asked to grab a 
shovel, he would return 
with a pitchfork. He 
couldn’t remember 
where things were. 
Distinguishing between 
one white sack of pig feed 
and another of chicken 
grain was a head- 
scratching, confusing 
task. Every time someone 
walked into the barn, 
Peter needed to run to 
say hello, and then forgot 
what he had been doing 
before. Peter would 
either spray a dribble of 
water into the stock tank 
before declaring that he 
was finished, or let the 
water run until the floor 
was a flood. Peter tried 
to focus, and wanted to 
succeed, but he needed 
a teacher beside him in 
order to do it.

Two years later, Peter is 
still that beautiful social 
butterfly, interested in 
everyone and smiling 
the most charming smile 
you have ever seen. But 
now he knows the job. 
He understands the 
routine, and he can call 
out the day’s tasks to 
the farmers when they 
arrive in the morning. He 
knows where every tool 
is and how to use them 
all. The water is filled 
to the brim, without a 
stray drop anywhere. 
He can tell the hay from 
the straw (not as easy 
a task as you might 
think), and pick the 
right fifty-pound grain 
bag from an anonymous 
pile of white sacks, with 
100% accuracy. Peter 
is enthusiastic about 
every task, however 

big or small. There are 
still some things to 
learn, but Peter works 
independently for long 
periods of time on 
difficult tasks and can 
team up with other 
students to efficiently 
accomplish things 
together. 

The changes that Peter 
has made are not 
only noticeable in his 
agricultural labor: His 
growing maturity and 
ability to get things done 
can be seen in every 
aspect of his life here. 
But it is the barn that 
motivates him the most. 
He knows he is needed 
and he knows how to 
help, and that has made 
all the difference.
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The Class 
of 2016

Andreas Schuschke shares reflections and recollections 
about the members of his senior class. As they embark 
on their next stage in their lives, we wish them all the 
best and our heartiest congratulations on the success 
they experienced at Beaver Run!

Jessica showed her incredible gifts in singing and acting during her performance as Eliza-
beth in our senior play, Frankenstein. Her beautiful smile and enthusiasm for learning has 
enriched the class. Although Jessica did not always spontaneously share it in class, she has 
an incredible store of knowledge from her time in school and could often give the right 
answer when asked a question during a lesson. Her knowledge will serve her well at the 
Transition Program at Beaver Farm.

Will is the social butterfly of the class! He kept all his friends and teachers engaged 
through endless conversations about trains, Christmas, camping trips, and, of course, 
Batman. He showed tremendous progress throughout high school in his ability to work 
and pay attention in class. Will’s incredible performance as the Creature in our play can be 
seen as the climax of his high school career. He will have many friends, new and old, to 
converse with at Beaver Farm.

Faisal came to us from far away and brought his gifts of observation and empathy for all 
the people that he encounters. He also made sure to keep us on track with the timetable 
each day by asking many questions about what was happening when. Faisal was quite the 
whirlwind when he first joined Camphill Special School, but has since grown into a more 
mature young man. Faisal will join the Transition Program at Beaver Farm this fall.

Jenna brought an element of uniqueness and enthusiasm to her work in school that 
deeply influenced the class. Always one to show interest in the subject at hand by asking 
thoughtful questions and digesting the content in her own distinct and creative way, she 
showed us from the beginning that she wants to do things her way. Over the years, Jenna 
has matured, coming to accept guidance and help while staying true to herself. Jenna will 
return home to California to continue her journey closer to her family.

Cyrus helped us care for the physical space that we were in through his incredible atten-
tion to detail and cleanliness. He joyfully carried out important chores for the class every 
school morning, no matter what the weather outside. His cheerfulness and easy-going 
attitude were an inspiration to the entire class. Cyrus will thrive at Beaver Farm!

Jordan was another one of our most enthusiastic students. Every day he showed his great 
desire to learn and brought sincerity and responsibility to his work. The greatest proof of 
how serious Jordan takes his work was his performance in our senior play; he spent many 
hours studying his lines, practicing how to act his part, and especially trying to speak 
loudly. Jordan’s enthusiasm will serve him well as a member of the Transition Program  
at Beaver Farm.

Noah helped all the students and teachers in the class connect through his gift of warmth 
and friendship. Always the first to get others excited to join him in a fun activity or playing 
a joke, he brought great liveliness to the classroom. Nevertheless, Noah is also a very hard 
worker and will not falter even when facing obstacles. He will join the Transition Program, 
so get ready for some laughs Beaver Farm!

Katie joined our class for senior year—and what a great addition! She showed incredible 
commitment to and interest in hands-on work and has a unique brand of cleverness. Katie 
made tremendous progress in her ability to control her emotions and be part of the class 
throughout the school morning. Her crowning moment was successfully performing a 
number of small parts in our senior play. Katie joins the Transition Program this fall.

Leta may be the smallest person in the class, but she definitely has the biggest personality! 
Her incredible tenacity and willpower in the light of ongoing serious health challenges 
were a great inspiration to everyone in the class. The fact that Leta was able to perform for 
our senior play and join our weeklong trip into remote, rural Vermont is evidence of her 
tremendous growth and achievement. Beaver Farm will welcome Leta to its ranks this fall.

Brandon always wanted to explore the classroom and his surroundings and was often 
restless, but with support from his aide he learned to stay with the class and participate in 
all activities. He always became very animated when we had birthday parties or had donuts 
for a snack! Brandon has matured significantly and will be a great addition to the Transition 
Program at Beaver Farm.

Laura joined our class two years ago and quickly became a leader and trusted friend for 
many. She always took her work very seriously and was an active participant in the edu-
cational program as well as the social life of school. She has tremendous artistic talents, 
especially as an actor, with her crowning achievement being her performance as  
Dr. Frankenstein in our senior play. Laura is sure to shine at Beaver Farm!
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Anonymous
Catherine and William 		
	 Bucher
Angie Butler
David Chester
Courtney M. Coffman
Amy and Warren R. Gleicher
Carol M. Goetz
Bill and Betsy Herman
Rosemary and Bob Huether
Christine Huston
Joyce and Ronald A. 		
	 Landon

John and Caroline 		
	 McCardell
Debbie Nickles and 
	 Richard Strayer*
Lucy Reid
Thomas and Marcy 		
	 Rosendale
Lee Smith 

*In memorium

The Pietzner 
Legacy Society

The members of our Pietzner Legacy Society listed below 
have chosen to support the mission of Camphill Special 
School through a gift in their estate plans. The Beaver Run 
Foundation invests and manages planned gifts for the 
long-term benefit of the school.

2015/ 
2016  
Financial 
Report
Thanks to our unique combination of long-term 
coworkers, residential volunteers, Camphill Academy 
students, and employed faculty and staff, Camphill 
Special School consistently keeps expenses in check and 
tuition at a rate significantly lower than other programs. 
Despite Pennsylvania’s seven-month budget impasse, 
the school was fortunate enough to avoid borrowing 
funds or using lines of credit to make ends meet. The 
school continues to make improvements to the aging 
infrastructure and is positioning itself with careful 
financial management to embark on a master plan that 
will lay the foundation for another 50 years of serving 
students with special needs.

With solid enrollment, thoughtful and conservative 
budgeting, as well as the generous outpouring of 
support from donors the school was able to complete 
Meadowsweet, our Early Learning Center, and add to 
our operating reserve funds. 

Tuition $7,323,189

Contributions – undesignated* $345,000

Program Services $862,725

Other $397,181

Administration/Marketing $411,745

Transportation, Special Services, & Misc. $225,306

Development $143,446

Insurance $961,505

Occupancy Costs $917,174

Program Cost $2,550,792

Residential Program Cost $883,251

Sta�/Trainee $1,632,547

Depreciation $904,055

Contributions – designated $343,102

Capital Expenditures of Designated 
Contributions $343,102

Expenses

$8,972,923

Support &
Revenue

$9,271,197

CLAUS SPROLL, DIRECTOR OF FINANCE

Tuition $7,323,189
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Program Services $862,725

Other $397,181

Administration/Marketing $411,745

Transportation, Special Services, & Misc. $225,306

Development $143,446

Insurance $961,505

Occupancy Costs $917,174

Program Cost $2,550,792

Residential Program Cost $883,251

Sta�/Trainee $1,632,547

Depreciation $904,055

Contributions – designated $343,102

Capital Expenditures of Designated 
Contributions $343,102

Expenses

$8,972,923

Support &
Revenue

$9,271,197

Tuition $7,323,189

Contributions – undesignated* $345,000

Program Services $862,725

Other $397,181

Administration/Marketing $411,745

Transportation, Special Services, & Misc. $225,306

Development $143,446

Insurance $961,505

Occupancy Costs $917,174

Program Cost $2,550,792

Residential Program Cost $883,251

Sta�/Trainee $1,632,547

Depreciation $904,055

Contributions – designated $343,102

Capital Expenditures of Designated 
Contributions $343,102

Expenses

$8,972,923

Support &
Revenue

$9,271,197

*	Contributions 	
	 are net of  
	 special events

	 Our auditors’  
	 report is  
	 available  
	 upon request.
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You: Our Donors
It is with great pleasure that we 
list our donors. With your support 
each and every student is able 
to receive an education suited to 
their own unique mind, body, and 
spirit. Through your generosity the 
children shine. Thank you!

Giving Circles
Angels	 $20,000+
Guardians	 $10,000–$19,999
Benefactors	 $5,000–$9,999
Pillars	 $2,500–$4,999
Champions	 $1,000–$2,499
Sustainers	 $500–$999
Advocates	 $250–$499
Supporters	 $100–$249
Friends	 $25–$99

KEY
P	 Parent
G	 Grandparent
C	 Coworker/Staff
B	 Board

You will find your name on the 
following pages if you contributed 
$25 or more or made an in-kind 
donation between July 1, 2015, and 
June 30, 2016. 

We also have the honor of 
recognizing your many years of 
dedication and consistent giving 
by using this color code: 

Purple	 20 or more years
Blue	 at least 15 years
Green	 at least 10 years
Red	 at least 5 years

While we make every effort to 
correctly list all of you, we do 
occasionally make mistakes. Please 
contact the Development Office at 
610.469.926 ext. 132 to alert us of 
any error or omission.  

ANGELS

Craig and April Adams (B)
Bill and Betsy Herman (B)
James R. Hodge	
Grant and Wendy Kvalheim

GUARDIANS

Evelyn and Stephen Colbert 
John R. Fish, O.D. (B)
Amy and Bill Hagner (P)
Bill and Jodi Keller (P)
Pat and Linda Marion	
Helen and Mark Rice (P)

BENEFACTORS

Anonymous	
Daniel Bowman	
Ms. Angie Butler 
Liz and Tim Kanavy	
 Lynette and Manuel Mattke	
 Vivian and Joseph  
	 Mauriello (P)
Carl and Lydia Schulze	
Andrew C. Stein 
Edward Strong and  
	 Laurel Durst

PILLARS

Sharon A. Bugelski	
Evan Evans and Lynn 
	 Garner (B)
Tim Folger and Wendy Weil
Douglas and Linda Gober	
Gene and Marie Grimaldi	
Robert and Rosemary 	
	 Huether (P, B)
Andrew and Stacy Jenkins (P) 
Eric Maskin	
Amanda and Rick Moseley (P)
Mr. and Mrs. Thomas 	
	 Nicholson
George F. Ohsiek, Jr.	
Drs. Andrew and Heather 	
	 Revelis (P)
Norbert Schultes (C)
Ari and Abby Segal (P)
Florence Short (G)
Alexander Vollkommer

CHAMPIONS

Anonymous (4)	
Heather and Mark Adams (P)
Sonja and Tobias Adams (B, C)
Michael and Roberta 
	 Aldrich (B)
Guy and Ani Alma (B, C)
Greg and Annie Ambrose (B)
Michael and Susan Arnold (G)
Jay Baker and  
	 Christiane Hertel (P)
Holly Berlin (P)
Charles and Jane Bingham	
Edward C. Callahan 
Eileen O’Shaughnessy-	
	 Coleman and John  
	 Coleman (P)
Christine and Robert 
	 Connell (P)

Steve and Leslie Connor	
Bob and Stephanie Corey	
Dave Czarnecki	
Anne Dobbs	
Kevin J. Doherty	
Lanny and Micki Edelsohn	
Peter Egan and  
	 Margaret Yu	
David and Kelly Faggioli	
Ralph Finerman	
Brent Franklin (B)
Tracy and John Gallagher (P)
Jan Christopher  
	 Goeschel, Ph.D. (B, C)
Mary Goodreau	
Van Beck and Paula Hall	
Joe and Kathleen Heenan	
Marc and Kathleen 	
	 Hembrough	
Harold and Bonnie 	
	 Himmelman	
Meredith and Oliver 
	 Howard (G)
Ann and George Hunter (G)
David and Allison Hunter (P)
JC Keeler	
Jeanette S. Lamb (G)
Kathleen and Michael 
	 Langen (P)	
Jill and Joseph Levy	
Mrs. Helen M. Lynch	
Lou and Kathy Martinelli	
Lainey Moseley (P)
Jackie Obniski	
Kristen and David O’Brien	
Lisa Paterson (P)
Kathleen and Michael Pickar	
Mr. and Mrs. Raymond J. 	
	 Ripper (B)
Linda Ritter (G)
Manuel and Melissa Rivelo	
Mr. and Mrs. Thomas R. 	
	 Rosendale (B)
Kathleen and Charles 
	 Rush (G)
Carol and Scott Sanders	
So-Chung Shinn	
Terrence and Kim Small (P)
Dean, Charlotte, and 
	 Paula Toburen	
Alex Ullrich	
Frederick and Gail Wallert
Brian and Bethany Ward	
Betty Shaw Weymouth	
Julianne Williams 
Fiona Young and 
	 Ted Boinske (P)

SUSTAINERS

Anonymous (4)	
Franny and Franny Abbott	
Philip and Kathleen Adelizzi	
Marjorie and Drew Alleva	
Ray and Rose Ambrose	
Edward Artim	
Bethany Asplundh	
Clara Bailey	
Jeffrey and Jean Beegle	
Cheryl and Chris Bode	
Stephanie and Michael Boldin	

 Carlyle and Suzanne 	
	 Brakensiek	
Bill and Sherry Brodhead	
Adrian Bryan-Brown and
	 Joan Marcus	
Sandy and Allen 
	 Buchanan (G)
Dawn Byers	
John and Carol Calsin	
Yvonne Cappello	
Perry and Judith Cartwright	
Craig and Dawn Cirafesi	
Craig and Courtney 
	 Coffman (C)
Dennis and Amy 
	 Colannino (P)
Elise Cox	
Mary Curik	
Luise Custer	
Pauline Dana	
Gina Davis (P)
Guy Diana	
Edward Doyle (P)
Lucille Eiland	
James R. Fairburn	
Janet Faust (C)
Erin Fisher	
Scott and Janice Fleming (G)
R. Bonnie Glaser	
Amy and Warren R. Gleicher	
	 Irwin Herling	
Tom Hess	
Ute Heuser (C)
Dari L. Horowitz	
Mitch and Anne Huber	
Janice Kane	
Jung Yeon Kim	
Edith H. Konopka	
Bob and Liz Kramer	
Carol Levin	
Jenny Jan-Luo and 
	 Jenn-Ching Luo (P)
Ian and Mary MacKinnon	
Lindsay and Mike McCarthy	
Karen and Steven Miner	
Luca and Judy Missoni (P)
Deborah Nickles 	
Jennifer Nilsen (B)
Mr. and Mrs. Brian J. 	
	 O’Connell (P)
Michael and Mary Beth 	
	 Peabody (P)
Scott and Barbara Pickard	
Mike and Joanna Pietrafitta	
Maria and Vincent 
	 Pitcherella (P)
Marlene and Donald Pollock	
Rita and Ammar Qubain (P)
Peter Robb and 
	 Marianne Hoffman
Sig Rutkowski (G)
David and Melanie Scott	
Bonnie and Brent Sheldon	
Ben and Amy Shobaken	
Gail and Michael Short (P)
Matthew and Ann Siefert	
Jon Sievers (G)
Mr. Ronald J. Stein	
Lucia and Joe Sun (P)
Mr. and Mrs. Jeffrey Taylor	
John and Deborah Thomas	

Edith and Joe Tobin	
Jennifer Vervier (P)
Amanda and Lawrence Vitale	
Jody Weaver and 
	 Michael Guerrisi 
Andrew P. Wickey and 
	 Mary G. Notaro	
Mike Williams and 
	 Sue Delaney	
Else and Bernie Wolf (B, C)
Marjorie and Lester 	
	 ZImmerman	

ADVOCATES

Anonymous (4)
James and Karen Alderfer	
Chris and Maureen Bauers (P)
John and Cass Beacham	
Michael and Pamela 
	 Benton (C)
Dr. and Mrs. Robert Bill	
Joseph I. Bishop	
Tom and Kristen Bissinger	
Thomas Carnevale and 	
	 Lauren Eustis	
Nancy and Ken Coffman	
Jon Cohen and Jody Hill	
Michael F. and 
	 Mary Anne Cola	
Len and Joy Cook (G)
Tim and Karen Cooper	
John A. Curran	
Laura and William Davis	
Beth DeLarato	
Jill and Kevin DiMichele (P)
Stephanie and Tony Doerr	
JoAnn and Dan Domanski	
Shirley Dyer	
Alletta and Ed Ebert (G)
Mr. and Mrs. Max Eisikovic	
Andrea Fanfera	
Mary Flagg	
Jake Franklin	
Frederick C. and Heidi V. 	
	 Frayer (P)
Rev. Leonard Freeman	
Ms. Linda Furst	
Mrs. Marie Furst	
Roger and Pat Garrett	
Ellen Gayda	
Steven D. Gerhard	
Gray Glenn	
Jeremy Good	
Steve and Bonnie Grizzell	
Stephanie and Paul Hamel	
Jeff and Marcia Hincks	
Kelly Huang
Michael and Susan 	
	 Innocenzo
Barbara James	
Dr. Rita Jones	
Susan K. Jung	
George and Jennifer Kelder	
Mrs. Genevieve J. 
	 Konopka (G)
Sandra Kowalski	
Mr. Thomas and Dr. Annette 	
	 Lambeth
Chaley J. Larson	
Annette Laskaris	

Lori Leathers (P)
Sally MacDonald (C)
Marianne McAndrew	
Mr. and Mrs. John  
	 McCardell III and Family	
Joseph and Marian McDevitt	
Bob and Amy McHugh (B, P)
Michael McLaughlin	
Shelley and Donald Meltzer	
Andrew Miller	
Colleen Minio	
Newton and Louise 	
	 Monschein	
Colleen and Bradley Mook (P)
Jennifer and Andrew Morrell	
Regine Moulton	
John Newton	
Dominic and Kimberly Pavia	
William and Grayce 
	 Pearce (G)
Jim and Brenda 
	 Pendergist (G)
Barbara Penna and 
	 Gary Goldsmith 
Anna Marie Pizzi (G)
Bill and Sharon Quinlan	
Dale and Sue Reichenbach	
Angelina Reyes-Almadanat	
Helen L. Ridenour	
Jonathan Rivin	
Tara and John 
	 Romanowich (P)
Steven R. Rosenblatt	
Brian and Susan Rushing (P)
Sondra Scharf	
Karen Schoewe	
Larry and Holly Stone	
Art Strassler	
William and Jennifer Sullivan	
Bainy Suri (P)
Ed and Bunnie 
	 Swetkowski (G)
Paula Toburen (C)
Chris and Amy Tormey	
Elaine Trent (P)
Steven G. Trojanov	
Kathleen and Joe Vervier (G)
Nick and Julie Wolfe

SUPPORTERS

Anonymous (6)	
Mildred and Norman Adler	
Dr. and Mrs. Theodore Adler	
Julie and Mark Andersen	
Diane Avillo	
Anne Aycock	
Seth and Sandra Bacon (C)
Sandra and Robert Bauers	
Susan Blumenfeld	
Kay Marie Boblenz	
Beth Ann Bogert
Michelle and Ronald Bradley	
William Earl Brecher	
Dr. Richard Bright	
Joe and Alicia Brisbois	
Bill and Catherine Bucher	
Robert and Suzanne Butler	
Jamie Callahan
Carsten H. Callesen (C)
Jessica Campbell
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Jacqueline Case	
Christina Chang	
David and Kimberly Chester	
Joseph and Marie Cirafesi (G)
Diana P. Cohen	
Abbie Connell (G)
Helen Walter-Creehan and 	
	 Dean Creehan (C)
Mary Cronin and 
	 John Esposito 
Jolie and Brian Crowe	
Maria Cuellar	
Stephen J. Cummings	
Letty Lee Dahme	
Chip and Cindy Davis	
Betsy and Anthony DeCecco	
Champshi Dedhiya	
Michelle DelCollo	
Brian Doles	
Richard and Geraldine 	
	 Donohue (G)
Sherry J. Dougherty	
Cornelia Elsholz	
Jane S. Fairburn	
Thomas T. 
	 Fenton, Jr.	
Erin Fisher	
Joy Frayer (G)
Laura Furiness	
Carole Gallagher	
Tony and Hope Gay	
Gerald and Patricia 	
	 Giardinelli	
Stephen and Carol Goetz	
CDR. and Mrs. William H. 	
	 Goetz	
Dr. Edward J. Grandt	
James A. Grant	
Mr. and Mrs. John Greene	
Michael and Debra 
	 Grindstaff (P)
Carol Guber
Robyn Gunn and 
	 Mike Schemeid	
Herbert and Adelaide Hagens	
Blaise and Tammy Hart (P)
David M. Hauptman 
Deborah Hayes and 
	 Michael Finger (P)
Daniel and Angela Heffernen	
Kristi and Dave Hertzog	
Kristin Herzog (G)
Marsha and Edward Hill	
Carol Himes	
Joel S. Hirschtritt, Esq.	
Peggy Hirt (C)
Joe and Margot 
	 Houston-Worfolk	
Jean and Charles Humphreys	
Andrea and Rudiger 
	 Janisch (C)
Sheila and Julia Johns	
Christopher and Leslie Jones	
Kris Kazmar	
Chad Kennedy and 
	 Chiara Di Marco	
Peter and Kim Korda	
Linda R. Layer
Patrick and Stephanie 	
	 Linskens (P)
Matthew and Sandra Lloyd	

James M. Macari	
Tiffany and Paul Maguire	
Michael and Maria Malone	
Kara Martillotti	
Scott and Marjorie McCray	
Terrance and Melissa 	
	 McGuigan (P) 
Nancy Bea Miller and 
	 Paul Downs
Todd and Kelly Miller	
Suzanne Monroe-Leeke	
Kent and Martha Mook (G)
Mona Moonis	
Fran D. Morgan (G)
Belinda Morrison	
Michael and Ellen Mulroney	
Kenneth and Moira Mumma	
Paul Mychaluk, D.C.	
Tom and Rita Nelson	
Andrew Ney	
Pierre and Christina Noack	
Jon and Kathleen Nuffer	
Rob Oelhaf	
Frank and Carole Ortner	
Franz J. Ostertag
Kim Pelkey and 
	 David Bushnell
John Perham and 
	 Christine Donohue (P)
Henry T. Petry	
Nancy Pitcherella	
Nancy and Gary Placko (G)
Susan Ploch	
Robert and Carole Poorman	
Edward Pugsley, CPA	
Mr. and Mrs. Herbert H. 	
	 Quarmby	
Bill and Leslie Rahling	
Stacey Remnitz	
Joseph Revolinsky, Jr.	
James Rice (G)
Kent and Nicole Rife	
Anne and Eric Rodgers	
Eva Romanowich	
Melissa Rush (P)
Margaret and Tim Sager	
Frank and Greta Salmons (P)
Peter Sander	
Mr. Vincent J. Santo	
Margo Pollins Schab	
Jerry Schaffner (G)
Victor and Catherine 	
	 Schaffner (P)
Cara Schmidt (C)
Michael and Tina Schmidt	
Tunde and Andreas 	
	 Schuschke (B, C)
David A. Schwartz and 
	 Ronald S. Sanchez	
Elliott Schwartz	
Joseph Sciarini	
Jacqueline Shaw (P)
Gurkiran Sidhu
Howard and Gloria 
	 Soloway (G)
Elizabeth Somers 
Mary Spalding and 
	 Mark Lazar	
Katherine Spitz
Jennifer Stearns	
Deanna and Henry Stueber	

Mr. and Mrs. Robert J. Swain	
Bob and Ginny Swain	
William and Margaret Tansey	
Chris and Melissa Teti	
Stephen Thal	
Sylva E. Toyos	
Jason Troester	
Leslie Tuder	
Suzanne and Rick Ullrich	
Diana and Nick Viglianese	
Yelena Vilensky	
Bob and Pat Violett (G) 
Kirsten Van Vlandren
Emily Vogel	
George Vogel (G)
Steve and Peggy Vogelman	
Mr. and Mrs. Robert 	
	 Vollkommer (G)
Thomas F. Weil	
David Werfel	
Melissa and Miles Wilding	
Scott Williams and 
	 Susan Braun	
Reed and Bernadette Wilson	
Becca Winiarski (C)
Dina and Eric Winter	
Dennis and Carmen 	
	 Wojtanowski	
Carolyn Woods	
Mr. and Mrs. Rich Yoegel	
William and Velvalee 
	 Young (G)
Stephanie Yuhas	
Lori Zabielski	
Mr. Adolph Zielke (G)

FRIENDS

Anonymous (4)	
Jerry and Nancie Arsenis	
Archana and Prashant 	
	 Badrinath	
Linda Baker	
Bob Banks	
Diane and John Barnes	
Nancy M. Beacham	
Jeffrey and Robin Belack	
Martin and Ruth Bell	
Brian Biggs	
Nancy Blanning	
Gregory Braccili	
Nancy Brown	
Tina and Peter Bruckner (C)
John P. Buchner	
James and Amy Caffry (P)
Kathleen Conway	
Ralph Cosenza	
Brian Courtney	
Geralyn Dal Balcon	
Stefania Lory Davis	
Robert F. Domergue	
Mary Ducca	
Charlotte Fassett	
Andrew and Lisa Fidler (P)
Larry Gauger	
Thomas German	
Michaela and Bob Godshall
Randee and Michael 	
	 Halvorsen	
Josh Han	
Jan Hannum	

Janet L. Herman	
Carol A. Hill	
Charles Hilston	
Carl Hirth	
David and Brenda Hollweger	
Elaine and Harvey Holtz	
Sue Horne	
Daniel and Cheryl Horwath	
Dan and Kris Houser	
Ellen S. Jarvis	
Kathleen Kane (P)
Irene Kopel	
Lisa Kramer	
Jurate Krokys	
Ron and Joyce Landon	
Bob and Sally Lane	
Camilla Lange	
Eileen M. Lloyd	
Joyce and Gerard LoDolce	
Jill Long	
Maureen Maksimoski	
Nicholas Malantonio (G)
Deborah Matyus	
Anita Miller (G)
Nora Minassian 
Jane Moore (C)
William Morgan (G)
Kay L. Muehlberger — 	
	 Elizabeth’s Mom (P)
Fran Murphy 
Tina Nathan 
Boel Neville 
Victoria C. Neville 
John and Christine Oram (P)
Robert Pottschmidt 
Jill Powell 
Sherri Quigley 
George and Melissa Reitnour	
Bob Roberson 
Akil Rodgers and Family 
Bernice A. Romano	
Dale Saul	
David Savage	
Scott J. Scheider	
Leo Schmidt and Melissa Bell	
Margaret Schmidt	
Janet Schucker	
Gilbert and Mary Jo Scott	
Richard Serafin	
Gloria, Howard, Jacob & 
	 Hali Shotz	
Paul and Angela Siana	
Joseph Somers	
Rozanne and Stephen 	
	 Spiecker	
Sada and Linda Subramanian	
Richard and Barbara Sury	
Dolores C. Swarm 
Kelly Tansey and 
	 Jeremy Good	
Gary Tate	
Jeff and Rosanne Taylor	
Shirley and Robert Teets (G)
Ken and Marie Thomas (G)
Bonnie Turner (G)
Roman Tybinko and 
	 Helen Mangelsdorf	
Joanne Vilaghy and 
	 Tom Buckner	
Eileen and Bob Walton	
Philip S. Weber	

Ms. Marilyn Williams	
Sandra and Robert Williams	
D. Wolok	
Christian Zygla

HONORARIUMS

In honor of Guy and 
	 Ani Alma	
 Luise Custer	
In honor of Joey Ambrose	
Ray and Rose Ambrose	
In honor of Ray and
	  Rose Ambrose	
 Joseph Sciarini	
In honor of the 
	 Armstrong Family	
Anne and Eric Rodgers	
In honor of Stephanie Baker	
Scott and Marjorie McCray	
In honor of Jessica Bates	
Randee and Michael 	
	 Halvorsen (P)
In honor of Cass Beacham	
Nancy Beacham 
Tina and Peter Bruckner (C)
Kay L. Muehlberger 
Elizabeth’s Mom (P)
In honor of Jonah Berlin	
Holly Berlin (P)
In honor of Kaylyn Bittinger	
Jon Sievers (G)
In honor of Jackson 	
	 Boinske
Anonymous	
In honor of Emma Brunner
Bill and Leslie Rahling 
In honor of Buey’s Teachers 	
	 and Supporting Staff	
Jenny Jan-Luo and 
	 Jenn-Chin Luo (P)	
In honor of Sam Bugelsi	
Andrew Miller	
In honor of Courtney 	
	 Coffman	
Cara Schmidt (C)
In honor of Nathan Collins	
Diane and John Barnes	
In honor of Jack Connell	
Gerald and Patricia 	
	 Giardinelli	
In honor of Chris Connor	
Steve and Leslie Connor	
In honor of Will Cook	
Joy and Len Cook (G)
In honor of Kate Dahme 	
	 and her happy years at 
	 Beaver Run	
Letty Lee Dahme	
In honor of Austin Davis	
Gina Davis (P)
In honor of Charlie 	
	 DiMichele	
Edward Callahan (G)
Mr. and Mrs. George Ohsiek	
In honor of Charles 	
	 Domergue	
Robert Domergue
In honor of Cassidy Epps
Frank and Carole Ortner 
In honor of the Epps family 

Yvonne Cappello	
In honor of Braden Fidler	
Craig and Dawn Cirafesi  
Joseph and Marie Cirafesi (G)
Diana and Nick Viglianese	
In honor of Julie Finger	
Ms. Deborah Hayes and  
	 Mr. Michael Finger (P)
In honor of Elizabeth Flynn	
Shirley and Robert Teets (G)
In honor of Nora Frayer	
Diane Avillo	
In honor of Michael 	
	 Freeman	
Rev. Leonard Freeman	
In honor of Dr. 
	 Richard Fried	
Susan Blumenfeld	
Andrew and Lisa Fidler (P)
Ellen Gayda	
John Greene	
Mrs. Genevieve J. 
	 Konopka (G)
Rick and Amanda Moseley (P)
David A. Schwartz and 
	 Ronald S. Sanchez	
 Sandra and Robert Williams	
 Alexander Vollkommer	
In honor of Cristina 
	 Ruiz Fuentes	
Beth Ann Bogert 
In honor of Emily Gallagher	
Carole Gallagher (G)
John and Tracy Gallagher (P)
Grayce and William 
	 Pearce (G)
Bill and Peggy Tansey	
In honor of Richard 	
	 Hauptman	
David Hauptman	
In honor of William C. 	
	 Herman	
Dr. and Mrs. Theodore Adler	
Berman Family Fund of the 	
	 Jewish Communal Fund	
Elise Cox	
Ralph Finerman	
James Hodge	
Dari L. Horowitz	
Mrs. Helen M. Lynch	
So-Chung Shinn	
In celebration of William C. 	
	 Herman, for his birthday 	
Stephen and Carol Goetz	
In honor of Noah Huether	
Jessica Campbell	
Mary Ducca	
Ellen Jarvis	
Joe and Margot 
	 Houston-Worfolk	
Robert and Rosemary 	
	 Huether (P)
George and Jennifer Kelder	
Deborah Matyus	
Paul and Marianne McAndrew 
Victoria Neville	
Susan Ploch	
Bunny and Sal Romano	
Gloria, Howard, Jacob, 	
	 and Hali Shotz	
Barbara and Richard Sury	

 In honor of Marcus Jenkins	
Carol Guber	
Howard and Gloria 
	 Soloway (G)
In honor of Maxine 	
	 Konopka	
Mrs. Genevieve J. 
	 Kanopka (G)
In honor of Haley Laconis	
Linda Ritter (G)
In honor of Delphine Lazar, 	
	 Class of 2016 Chicago 	
	 Waldorf School	
Mark Lazar and 
	 Mary Spalding	
In honor of Longhouse	
Ms. Deborah Hayes and 
	 Mr. Michael Finger (P)
Jenny Jan-Luo and 
	 Jenn-Chin Luo (P)
In honor of Galya and 	
	 Connie Lowe	
 Sherry Dougherty	
In honor of Joseph 	
	 Mauriello	
Vivian and Joseph 
	 Mauriello (P)
Manuel and Melissa Rivelo	
In honor of Katelyn 	
	 McGuigan	
Fran D. Morgan (G)
In honor of Ellie McHugh	
Bob and Sue Butler	
Bob and Amy McHugh (P)
Kyle McHugh	
Libby McHugh	
Amy and Ben Shobaken	
In honor of Josh McQuide	
Anonymous	
In honor of Matthew Miller	
Anita F. Miller (G)
In honor of Ellie Mook	
Colleen and Brad Mook (P)
In honor of Brandon Neel	
Anonymous	
In honor of Jon R. 
	 Nuffer, Jr.	
Jon and Kathleen Nuffer	
In honor of the 
	 Pannill Family	
Anne and Eric Rodgers	
In honor of Wyatt Paterson	
Lisa Paterson (P)
Brian and Bethany Ward	
In honor of Matthew 	
	 Pendergist	
James and Brenda 
	 Pendergist (G)
In honor of Glenn Perham	
Rev. Brian Doles	
Richard and Geraldine 	
	 Donohue (G)
Mt. Zion Presbyterian Church	
In honor of Antonio 	
	 Pitcherella	
Nancy Pitcherella (G)
 In honor of Kathleen 	
	 Rahling	
Mrs. Joseph V. Somers	
In honor of Frank Revelis	
Meredith and Oliver 

	 Howard (G)
Kyle Mangels Family Fund	
In honor of Heather Revelis	
Irene Kopel	
In honor of Noah and 
	 Ray Ripper	
Mr. and Mrs. Herbert H. 	
	 Quarmby	
In honor of Akil Rodgers	
Barbara James	
In honor of Eva 	
	 Romanowich	
Bonnie Turner (G)
In honor of Paige Rush	
Charlie and Kathy Rush (G)
In honor of Becky 	
	 Rutherford	
 Anonymous	
Tina and Peter Bruckner (C)
Kay L. Muehlberger - 	
	 Elizabeth’s Mom (P)
In honor of Melanie Sabra 	
	 and Nicky Smith	
Scott and Janet Werfel	
In honor of Bud and Leah 	
	 Schlenger, on their 70th 	
	 Anniversary	
Jerry Schaffner (G)
In honor of Cara Schmidt	
Guy and Ani Alma (C)
Kay Marie Boblenz	
Molly and Petey Cole	
Vinny Francois	
Margaret Schmidt	
Susie Schmidt	
Francie, Jack, and 
	 Seamus Wallace	
In honor of Norbert 	
	 Schultes	
Luise Custer	
In honor of Brian Spiecker	
Rozanne and Stephen 	
	 Spiecker	
In honor of Elsbeth 	
	 Sunstein	
Jenn-Ching Luo and 
	 Jenny Jan-Luo (P)
In honor of Leo Swetkowski	
Ed and Bunnie 
	 Swetkowski (G)
In honor of Ginny Thimme	
Luise Custer	
In honor of Ella Thomas	
Ken and Marie Thomas (G)
In honor of Bobby Trofa	
Nicholas Malantonio (G)
In honor of Charlie Tygiel	
Joanne Dresner and 
	 Jerry Linsner	
In honor of Alex Ullrich	
Bob Banks	
Brian Biggs	
Thomas German 
Josh Han	
Kris Kazmar	
Eileen Lloyd	
Maria and Michael Malone	
Fran and Monica Murphy	
Robert Pottschmidt	
Scott Scheider	
Suzanne and Rick Ullrich	

In honor of Alexander 	
	 Vollkommer	
 Daniel Bowman	
In celebration of the 	
	 marriage of Pamela Ward 	
	 and Clifford Kohn	
Lou and Kathy Martinelli

MEMORIALS

In memory of Shakeya 	
	 Blumenfeld	
Susan Blumenfeld	
In memory of David 	
	 Champion	
Phyllis Champion	
In memory of Caroline 	
	 Chester	
Penni and John Greene	
In memory of Franny Court	
Anonymous	
In memory of David Herman	
Janet L. Herman	
In memory of Sarah 
	 Jane Herman	
Penni and John Greene	
Stacey Remnitz	
In memory of 
	 Frederick Herzog	
Kristin Herzog (G)
In memory of Kate Huether	
Susan Ploch	
In memory of Lieutenant 	
	 Frederick W. Kulicke III	
The Kulicke Fund	
In memory of Beatrice 	
	 Malantonio	
Nicholas Malantonio (G)
In memory of Jean 
	 Mateer-Gray	
Dr. Rita Jones	
In memory of Laurie Meluso	
Sue Horne	
In memory of Eleanor Patyk	
Sharon A. Bugelski	
In memory of Ursel Pietzner	
Dr. Richard Bright	
Nancy Brown	
Tina and Peter Bruckner (C)
Courtney and Craig 	
	 Coffman (C)
Mr. and Mrs. Champshi 	
	 Dedhiya 	
James Fairburn	
Charlotte Fassett	
Janet Faust (C)
Penni and John Greene	
Herbert and Adelaide Hagens	
Bill and Betsy Herman (B)
Kristin Herzog (G)
Thomas Hess	
Dr. Charles and 
	 Marlyn Hilston	
Carl Hirth	

Andrea and Rudiger 
	 Janisch (C)	
Christopher and Leslie Jones	
Robert and Elizabeth Kramer	
Ronald and Joyce Landon	
Thomas and Annette Laskaris	

Carol Levin	
Rick and Amanda Moseley (P)
Kenneth and Moira Mumma	
Boel Neville	
Andrew and Joselyn Ney	
Deborah Nickles	
Pierre and Christina Noack	
The Norris Family 
	 Charitable Fund	
Marlene and Donald Pollock	
Akil Rodgers	
Mr. and Mrs. Thomas 	
	 Rosendale (B)
David A. Schwartz and 
	 Ronald S. Sanchez	
Andreas and Tunde 	
	 Schuschke (C)
Elliott and Lenore Schwartz	
Stern Nester Paving, Inc.	
Jeff and Roseanne Taylor	
Edith and Joe Tobin	
Triskeles Foundation 
Triskeles Inc.	
Roman Tybinko and 
	 Helen Mangelsdorf	
Julianne Williams	
Marilyn and Ray Williams	
Reed and Bernadette Wilson	
Carmen and Dennis 	
	 Wojtanowski	
Lester and Marjorie 	
	 Zimmerman	
In memory of Jason Pollock	
Marlene and Donald Pollock	
In memory of Doris 	
	 Rutkowski	
Mr. and Mrs. David Savage	
In memory of Shirley 	
	 Schwartz	
Janet Schucker	
Robert and Eileen Walton	
In memory of Thorsten 	
	 Thimme	
Anne Aycock	
In memory of Virginia 	
	 Vilella	
Katherine Spitz	
In memory of Denise 	
	 Zacharias	
Anonymous

CORPORATIONS AND 
ORGANIZATIONS

Anonymous
AAA
Advertise Publicize, LLC
Archer & Buchanan 	
	 Architecture, LTD
Arthur Hall Insurance
Asplundh Tree Expert Co.
Business Clubs America of 	
	 Philadelphia
Campbell, Rappold & 
	 Yurasits LLP
Carnevale Eustis 
	 Architects, Inc.
CertaPro Painters of the 	
	 Main Line
CH&E Construction
Chase Toppers
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CSI International, Inc.
Customers Bank
CzarStar Security
D.G. March & Associates
Delaney & Scott, P.C.
Delaware Center for Maternal 	
	 and Fetal Medicine
Donna’s Cleaning 
	 Service, Inc.
Eagle Eye Associates
The Eagle Gallery
Eden Horticulture LLC
Elaine’s Flowers & 	
	 Greenhouses
Elliott-Lewis
fmi direct, inc.
Foundation Stone 
	 High School
Fox Rothschild LLP
Glackin Thomas Panzak, Inc.
Great Valley Pool Service, Inc.
H.D.I. Associates, Inc.
Henkels & McCoy, Inc.
Hinkle, Fingles, Prior & 	
	 Fischer, P.C.
IEI Group, Ltd.
Interstate Battery System Of 	
	 Reading, Inc.
Kimberton Whole Foods, Inc.
Kistler Tifffany Benefits Co.
Lionville Dental 
	 Associates, LLC
Ludwig’s Village Market & 	
	 Caterers
Mark Owen Mandel, Esq.
McMahon Automotive Group
MD Advantage Insurance 	
	 Company of NJ
Melaleuca, Inc.
Modern Doll, Inc.
OMNIA Group Architects
One Liberty 
	 Observation Deck
Optima Computer & Training 	
	 Services, Inc.
Paul Restall Company, Inc.
PECO
Philips Brothers Electrical 	
	 Contractors, Inc.
PJM Interconnection
Pottstown Roller Mills, Inc.
PreDoC, Inc.
ProShred
Riley Riper Hollin & 	
	 Colagreco
Rocky Hill Farm 
	 Chainsaw Shop
Seide Financial Group
Select Sire Power Inc.
SITE Engineering 
	 Concepts, LLC
David Dumont, Snap-On 	
	 Tools Franchisee
Stern Nester Paving, Inc.
Stradley Ronon Stevens & 	
	 Young, LLP
Synthesis Consulting, Ltd
T.O. Epps & Associates
Target
Tennis Addiction Sports Club
Todd’s Tree Service

Univest — Banking, 	
	 Insurance, Investments
Unlimited Technology, Inc.
Utility Line Services, Inc.
Vic’s Refrigeration & 	
	 Appliance Service
The Westover Companies
Wexler Consulting
Whitford Insurance Network
Why Not Farm

FOUNDATIONS

AmazonSmile Foundation
ARK Foundation
Beaver Run Foundation
Berman Family Fund of the 	
	 Jewish Communal Fund
Box Tops for Education
Camphill Foundation
Chester County Community 	
	 Foundation
Circle of Life Foundation
Colbert Family Fund 	
	 of Coastal Community 	
	 Foundation of SC
The Desperito Foundation
Fidelity Charitable Gift Fund
The Gettinger Family 	
	 Foundation
Joseph P. Heenan Family 	
	 Foundation
Hollenbach Family 	
	 Foundation, a Fund of the 	
	 Chester County 	
	 Community Foundation
Jephson Educational Trusts
The Kulicke Fund
Landon Family Foundation
Kyle Mangels Family Fund 
The Page and Otto Marx Jr. 	
	 Foundation 
Joanne E. McCready 
	 Irrev Trust
National Philanthropic Trust
The Norris Family 
	 Charitable Fund
Phoenixville Community 	
	 Health Foundation
Drs. Andrew and Heather 	
	 Revelis Family Foundation
Rigg Family Foundation,
	 A Fund of the Chester 	
	 County Community 	
	 Foundation
Rogers Reunion Association
Rudolf Steiner Charitable 	
	 Trust Fund of RSF Social 	
	 Finance
The Hoxie Harrison Smith 	
	 Foundation
Triskeles Foundation
Tulsa Community Foundation
The Vanguard Group 	
	 Foundation 
The Paula Vial Fund of the 	
	 Jewish Communal Fund 
The Woman’s Club of 	
	 Downingtown
Wright-Cook Foundation

WORKPLACE GIVING

Achievers
Aetna Foundation, Inc.
America’s Charities
Benevity Community 
	 Impact Fund
Exelon Foundation
Network For Good
Truist Credit/United Way
United Way Of Central and 	
	 Northeastern Connecticut
United Way of Chester 	
	 County
United Way Of Delaware
United Way Of Greater 	
	 Philadelphia and Southern 	
	 New Jersey
United Way Of York County
Vanguard Community Fund
Voya Foundation

MATCHING GIFT PROVIDERS

Exelon Foundation
GE Foundation
GlaxoSmithKline Foundation
Merck Foundation
Neustar Matching 
	 Gifts Program
Pfizer Foundation Matching 	
	 Gifts Program
PJM Interconnection
The Stop & Shop 	
	 Supermarket 
	 Company LLC
The Williams Companies, Inc.
Vanguard Group Foundation
Verizon Foundation

EDUCATIONAL  
IMPROVEMENT TAX  
CREDIT PARTICIPANTS

DNB First
Gallagher, McDevitt, 	
	 Schalleur & Surgent, LLC 	
	 on behalf of Lauren 	
	 Adamski
SKF USA Inc.
UHS of Pennsylvania, Inc.
Univest — Banking, 	
	 Insurance, Investments

IN-KIND

Anonymous
acac Fitness & Wellness
Advanced Staging 	
	 Productions
Air Ventures Balloon 
	 Flights, Inc.
Greg and Annie Ambrose
American Helicopter Museum 	
	 and Education Center
Arden Theatre Co.
Arnold’s Family Fun Center
John and Cass Beacham
Berkshire Mountain Distillers
Brandywine River 
	 Museum of Art
Brûlée Catering
C.M. Kristman, Inc.

Senator Robert P. Casey, Jr.
CH&E Construction
Phyllis Champion
Chanticleer Foundation
Chester Springs Family 	
	 Dentistry
Marie C. Cirafesi (G)
Christine and Robert 
	 Connell (P)
Congressman Ryan Costello
Couture — Anshul 
	 Gambhir, M.D.
Create A Scene/Charlestown 	
	 Cafe Club
CzarStar Security
Nancy Davis
Delaware Museum of 
	 Natural History
The Desmond Hotel
DialysisPPO
Dick’s Sporting Goods
Dutch Wonderland
Eagle Eye Associates
Eastern State Penitentiary
Brent Franklin (B)
Great Clips
Hampton Inn
Blaise and Tammy Hart (P)
Henry A. Davidsen, Master 	
	 Tailors and Image 	
	 Consultants
Robert and Rosemary 	
	 Huether (P)
Hunterdon Distributors
Lehigh Valley IronPigs 	
	 Charities
Andrew and Traci Lee Kaplan
Kimara Ahnert
Knoebels
Elizabeth and Peter 
	 Konopka (P)
Jennifer Ritter Laconis (P)
Robin Langerhans
Manatawny Still Works
Mary Kay Cosmetics
McCaffrey’s Food Markets
Mr. and Mrs. John 
	 McCardell III and Family
Media Theatre
Shelley and Donald Meltzer
Mercurius
Nicholas Smith Toys
One Liberty 
	 Observation Deck
PECO
Penn Museum
People’s Light and Theatre 	
	 Company
Pepperidge Farm, Inc.
Philadelphia Flyers
The Philadelphia Phillies
Phoenixville Foundry
Prestige Color
Reading Fightin Phils
Red Lion Inn
Drs. Andrew and Heather 	
	 Revelis (P)
Rivercrest Golf Club
Ron’s Original Bar & Grille
Salon di Vita
Cara Schmidt (C)

David and Melanie Scott
Seven Stars Inn
Matthew and Ann Siefert
Phillip Silverstone
Spike’s Trophies Limited
T.O. Epps & Associates
Rosemarie Tamburro
Tango
Temple University Athletics
Tennis Addiction Sports Club
Stephen Thal
Theraplay Inc.
Today’s Systems
Tom Pepe Photography
Topiary
Trader Joe’s
Trattoria San Nicola
Turpin Landscaping, Inc.
Unlimited Technology, Inc.
Villanova Department of 	
	 Athletics
WaldorfClothing.com
Amy and Steve Walker
Walt Disney World Company
Wegmans Collegeville
Wharton Esherick Museum
Whole Foods Market
Winterthur
Woodmere Art Museum



1784 Fairview Road, Glenmoore, PA 19343 
610.469.9236 camphillspecialschool.org

Camphill Special School’s mission is to create wholeness for children and 
youth with developmental disabilities through education, extended family 
living, and therapy so that they may be better understood, they may more 
fully unfold their potential, and they may meaningfully participate in life.

JOIN US ON FACEBOOK.

FSC Logo

2015/2016 BOARD OF DIRECTORS

Craig L. Adams, President

Tom Rosendale, Treasurer

Claus Sproll, Secretary

Sonja Adams

Berta Aldrich

Guy Alma

Gregory P. Ambrose

John R. Fish, O.D.

Brent Franklin

Lynn Garner

Jan Christopher Goeschel. Ph.D.

William C. Herman, Esq.

Rosemary Huether

Felicity Jeans

Amy P. McHugh

Jennifer Nilsen

Sarah Schreck

Andreas Schuschke

Bernard Wolf

EMERITI

Manfred Maier Raymond Ripper

Join the growing ranks of the Pietzner Legacy Society by naming our supporting foundation, 
Beaver Run Foundation, in your will or other estate plans. See page 32 or call Courtney Coffman 

at 610.469.9236 for more information.

Camphill Special School does not discriminate on the basis of race, age, color, creed, gender, 
sexual orientation, national or ethnic origin, or disability.

Waldorf® is a registered service mark of the Association of Waldorf Schools of North America 
(AWSNA) and used by agreement of membership in AWSNA.


